
$95,000 - W Horse Ride Loop (unit 55), Benson
MLS® #6726588 

$95,000
0 Bedroom, 0.00 Bathroom, 
Land on 3 Acres

RED HAWK AT J-SIX RANCH, Benson, AZ

Executive 3-Acre Lot with Panoramic Views -
Prime Location!

Discover the perfect blend of tranquility and
convenience with this stunning 3-acre
executive lot. Nestled in a neighborhood of
beautiful homes, this property offers
breathtaking views that stretch for miles.

Key Features:

Spacious Three Acres: Enjoy ample space for
your dream home, outdoor living, and more.
Utilities at the Border: All essential utilities are
conveniently located at the property border,
perc test complete registers a conventional
system & a the water meter has been
installed-saving you thousands-making it
easier to develop.
Prime Location: Just a short commute to the
I-10 freeway, ensuring easy access to all the
amenities you need. Proximity to Tucson
Airport: Less than an hour drive from Tucson
International Airport�ideal for frequent
travelers.
Scenic Views: Take in the stunning vistas from
every angle
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breathtaking views that stretch for miles.

Key Features:

Spacious Three Acres: Enjoy ample space for
your dream home, outdoor living, and more.
Utilities at the Border: All essential utilities are
conveniently located at the property border,
making it easier to develop.
Prime Location: Just a short commute to the
I-10 freeway, ensuring easy access to all the
amenities you need.
Proximity to Tucson Airport: Less than an hour
drive from Tucson International Airport�ideal
for frequent travelers.
Scenic Views: Take in the stunning vistas from
every angle.
Protective CCRs: Covenants, Conditions, and
Restrictions are in place to protect your
investment and maintain the high-quality
standards of the neighborhood.
Community: Located in a sought-after area
known for its upscale homes and friendly
community vibe.
This lot provides the perfect canvas to build
your custom home while enjoying the peace
and serenity of open spaces. Imagine waking
up to the spectacular mountain views and
ending your day with the picturesque Arizona
sunset.

Don't miss this rare opportunity to secure such
a desirable property.

Essential Information

MLS® # 6726588

Price $95,000

Bathrooms 0.00

Acres 3.00

Type Land

Status Active



Community Information

Address W Horse Ride Loop (unit 55)

Subdivision RED HAWK AT J-SIX RANCH

City Benson

County Cochise

State AZ

Zip Code 85602

Amenities

View Mountain(s)

School Information

District Benson Unified School District

Elementary Other

Middle Other

High Other

Additional Information

Zoning Rurak Res

Listing Details

Listing Office Real Broker

 Information Deemed Reliable But Not Guaranteed. All information should be verified by the recipient and
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