
$428,500 - 22065 W Twilight Trail, Buckeye
MLS® #6830088 

$428,500
4 Bedroom, 2.00 Bathroom, 2,132 sqft
Residential on 0 Acres

WINDMILL VILLAGE, Buckeye, AZ

Step into your dream home in the heart of
Buckeye! This 4bd/2bth gem isn't just a
houseâ€”it's your next adventure waiting to
happen. The open-concept living space
screams ''Netflix marathons here,'' and the
split floor plan keeps the peace when you
need it most. Featuring a bonus room perfect
for a home office, playroom, or workout area.

Sitting on a massive lot with an RV gate,
there's room for all your big ideasâ€”whether
it's hosting gatherings, building your dream
garden or finally finding a spot for that RV
you've been eyeing. The freshly painted
interior and exterior give off ''new home vibes''
without the new home price tag. Especially
with a new in 2025 HVAC! 

A sweet little neighborhood park is just around
the corner. Plus, you're mere minutes from
freeways, foodie hotspots and the kind of
hiking trails that make your social media
followers jealous.

Built in 2008

Essential Information

MLS® # 6830088

Price $428,500

Bedrooms 4

Bathrooms 2.00

Square Footage 2,132



Acres 0.21

Year Built 2008

Type Residential

Sub-Type Single Family Residence

Style Spanish

Status Active

Community Information

Address 22065 W Twilight Trail

Subdivision WINDMILL VILLAGE

City Buckeye

County Maricopa

State AZ

Zip Code 85326

Amenities

Amenities Playground, Biking/Walking Path

Utilities APS

Parking Spaces 4

Parking RV Gate

# of Garages 2

View Mountain(s)

Pool None

Interior

Interior Features Granite Counters, Double Vanity, Separate Shwr & Tub

Appliances Electric Cooktop

Heating Electric

Cooling Central Air, Ceiling Fan(s)

Fireplaces None

# of Stories 1

Exterior

Exterior Features Storage

Lot Description Sprinklers In Rear, Sprinklers In Front, Desert Back, Desert Front, Auto
Timer H2O Front, Auto Timer H2O Back

Windows Dual Pane

Roof Tile

Construction Stucco, Wood Frame, Painted, Block



School Information

District Buckeye Union High School District

Elementary Liberty Elementary School

Middle Liberty Elementary School

High Youngker High School

Listing Details

Listing Office New Nest Group
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